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5. Geographie an der Universität 

Geographie kann man an drei Universitäten studieren: an der Nationalen Mongo­

lischen Universität in Ulan Bator, an einer Zweigstelle derselben in Kovdo 

Allnag und an der Staatlichen Pädagogischen Universität. Die beiden ersteren 

Universitäten bilden geographische Wissenschaftler aus, etwa Permafrostfor­

scher, Pedologen, Klimatologen und Wirtschafts- und Kulturgeographen. Einige 

von ihnen können Geographielehrer werden. Das Ziel der Staatlichen Pädagogi­

schen Universität ist die Ausbildung der Geographielehrer. Das Studium dauert 

vier Jahre und wird mit einem Bakkalaureat abgeschlossen. Die Lehramtsstudie­

renden werden in Basisfächern wie Pädagogik, Psychologie, Computeranwen­

dung, Philosophie, Geschichte und Wirtschaftswissenschaften mit einem Anteil 

von 20% am Gesamtstudium ausgebildet, das Hauptfach Geographie nimmt 50% 

des Studienplanes ein, Fremdsprachen (Englisch, Russisch, Japanisch usw.) 30%. 

In der Geographie gibt es drei verschiedene Unterrichtsformen: Vorlesungen, 

Seminare und Exkursionen. 

Geographie als Pflichtfach urnfaßt an der Staatlichen Pädagogischen Universität 

folgende Fächer: 

- Allgemeine Physische Geographie 

Kartographie 

Wirtschaftsgeographie der Mongolei 

Physische Geographie der Mongolei 

- Physische Geographie der Kontinente 

- Wirtschafts- und Sozialgeographie des Auslands 

Meteorologie und Klimatologie 

- Hydrologie 

- Bodengeographie 

- Methodologie und Didaktik der Geographie 

- Industrie- und Agrargeographie 

- Geographie des Tourismus 

- Geographie des Tourismus der Mongolei 

- Geographie des Nahraums. 

Als Wahlfach werden folgende Themen angeboten: 

- Stadtgeographie 

- Astronomie 

- Klimatologie der Mongolei 

- Geologie der Mongolei 
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- Geographie des Transportwesens 

- Landschaftskunde 

- Herstellung geographischer Karten. 

Die Hochschulausbildung in der Geographie hat sich nach 1990 nicht wesentlich 

verändert. Neu ist ein Trainingszentrum für die Geographie des Tourismus. Es 

entstand 1993, als der Kurs "Lehrer der Geographie - Geographen des Touris­

mus" vom Institut für Geographie an der Staatlichen Pädagogischen Universität 

eingerichtet wurde, um Spezialisten für den wachsenden Bedarf im Touris­

mussektor der Mongolei zu haben. Das war der erste Versuch an Hochschulen 

der Mongolei, Tourismuspersonal auszubilden. In der Zukunft müssen wir die 
Geographie an den Universitäten weiter verbessern. Vor allem die Stadtgeogra­

phie und die Allgemeine Geographie müssen ebenso wie die Fernerkundung ver­

stärkt behandelt werden. 

Offen gesagt sind wir doch ein wenig hinter die zeitgenössische Geographie zu­

rückgefallen, besonders im Bereich der Regionalen Geographie. Es ist viel zu 

tun. 

Research in Geographkai Education: Retrospect and Prospece 

von MICHAEL WILLIAMS (Swansea) 

It is a great pleasure and an honour to be present in Freiburg today to recognise 

the work of Hartwig Haubrich. F or more than twenty years I have been privileged 

to collaborate with him on several projects: writing chapters in books and jour­

nals that he has edited, visiting schools and engaging in gathering research data; 

organising a Council of Europe course; and witnessing his considerable contribu­

tion to the success of the Commission on Geographical Education of the Interna­

tional Geographical Union. In preparing this paper I have re-read much of his 

writing in English and I have sought to highlight those publications that I know 

best. 

Paper presented by Professor Michael Williams. University of Wales Swansea on the occasion of the 
Festkolloquium organised by the Pädagogische Hochschule Freiburg in honour of Professor Dr. 
Hartwig Haubrich. November 7th. 1997. 
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1. Introduction 

In considering the diverse aspects of research in geographical education and 
reviewing the work of Hartwig Hau brich, I was faced with the choice of focusing 
either on research methods and their application to studies in geographical edu­
cation or on the principal issues that geographical education researchers have 
addressed in recent years. I have chosen the latter approach and structured my 
review on three broad issues: the nature of geography in an educational context; 
how students learn geography; and how teachers teach geography. Before taking 
each of these in turn, there are a nurober of introductory remarks I need to make 

in order to contextualise my discussion. 

First, research in geographical education is not conducted with the same breadth 
and depth as characterises research in some other curriculum areas. If we con­
sider the educational research work undertaken in languages, science and 
mathematics, we notice the substantial amount of international, governmental and 
non-governmental research funding that has been directed at studies conducted at 

various Ievels: international, national and local. This has led to the creation of 
research groups within universities, to the proliferation of refereed journals dedi­

cated to sub-fields, and to the regular meetings of researchers with particular 
specialist interests in national and international conferences and symposia. 
Researchcrs in geographical education have very limited access to research funds, 
they are often isolated individuals employed either in faculties of education or in 

specialist geography departrnents, there are remarkably few refereed journals 
specialising in research in geographical education, and conferences and symposia 

usually have generalrather than specialist sub-field characteristics. 

Secondly, we must also acknowledge the rapid increase in the amount and range 
of work undertaken in research in geographical education over the last twenty 
years. Clear evidence of this can be found in the bibliographical work currently 
reaching a conclusion by Bill Marsden and Nick Foskett, on behalf of the British 

Sub-Committee of the Commission on Geographical Education of the Interna­
tional Geographical Union. They have amassed the titles of more than 4,000 
publications produced in the English language over the last twenty five years 
concerned with geographical education and the classification runs to five major 

headings, 33 sub-headings and many more headings within these. We have 
moved a considerable way since the five headings used in a classification pro­
duced by Long in 1964 and the increasingly sophisticated classifications used by 

Naish in 1972, Lukehurst and Graves in 1972 and Corney in 1982. All of these 
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bibliographies, that drew only on the English langnage literature, have been 
carefully reviewed by John Lidstone in 1988. 

Thirdly, researchers from one language domain are generally unfamiliar with 
research undertaken in other language domains. Even when there is a possibility 
for researchers to present their work in either French or English, as in the sym­
posia of the Commission on Geographical Education of the International Geo­

graphical Union, remarkably few papers are presented in French. Researchers in 

geographical education from the Enghsh language domain very rarely quote 

recent research reported in languages other than English. This paper draws its 
evidence predominantly from research undertaken by workers in the English lan­
guage - and is limited by that. 

Fourthly, it is important to distinguish between researchdriven by the traditional 
educational disciplines - educational psychology, sociology of education, phi­
losophy of education and history of education - and research that is driven by 
concerns related to curriculum planning and curriculum implementation. For the 
latter the research motive is more to improve the institutional provision of geog­
raphy in schools, colleges and universities, rather than to progress the discipline 
of research in geographical education. Obvious consequences of this are, on the 
one hand, the need for researchtobe responsive to others' agendas and, on the 

other hand, the lack of continuity and linearity of studies. From this comes a ten­
sion between pure research and applied research and in geographical education 
there has conventionally been a strong leaning towards the latter. 

Fif1hly, we need to acknowledge the different emphases given by researchers in 
geographical education to the purposes of research. On one end of the spectrum 
are those who argue that all educational research should be driven by utilitari­
anism - the fruits of research should be seen in teaching and learning contexts. 
Research is the handmaiden of the geography teacher and the geography learner. 

At the other end of the spectrum are those who would argue that research has its 
own intri.nsic worth. The act of research is significant for the researcher, in the 
frrst instance, and then for those colleagues in the research community who share 
a mutual research interest - substantive or methodological. Those who favour the 
utilitarian position fmd themselves torn between local and national interests 
rather than international interests and there is always a temptation to engage more 
in narrative description than empirical investigation. They also fmd themselves 
drawn to the descriptions of work in progress as in the case of accounts of na­
tional or highly localised curriculum development projects, national changes in 

126 



1. Introduction 

In considering the diverse aspects of research in geographical education and 
reviewing the work of Hartwig Hau brich, I was faced with the choice of focusing 
either on research methods and their application to studies in geographical edu­
cation or on the principal issues that geographical education researchers have 
addressed in recent years. I have chosen the latter approach and structured my 
review on three broad issues: the nature of geography in an educational context; 
how students learn geography; and how teachers teach geography. Before taking 
each of these in turn, there are a nurober of introductory remarks I need to make 

in order to contextualise my discussion. 

First, research in geographical education is not conducted with the same breadth 
and depth as characterises research in some other curriculum areas. If we con­
sider the educational research work undertaken in languages, science and 
mathematics, we notice the substantial amount of international, governmental and 
non-governmental research funding that has been directed at studies conducted at 

various Ievels: international, national and local. This has led to the creation of 
research groups within universities, to the proliferation of refereed journals dedi­

cated to sub-fields, and to the regular meetings of researchers with particular 
specialist interests in national and international conferences and symposia. 
Researchcrs in geographical education have very limited access to research funds, 
they are often isolated individuals employed either in faculties of education or in 

specialist geography departrnents, there are remarkably few refereed journals 
specialising in research in geographical education, and conferences and symposia 

usually have generalrather than specialist sub-field characteristics. 

Secondly, we must also acknowledge the rapid increase in the amount and range 
of work undertaken in research in geographical education over the last twenty 
years. Clear evidence of this can be found in the bibliographical work currently 
reaching a conclusion by Bill Marsden and Nick Foskett, on behalf of the British 

Sub-Committee of the Commission on Geographical Education of the Interna­
tional Geographical Union. They have amassed the titles of more than 4,000 
publications produced in the English language over the last twenty five years 
concerned with geographical education and the classification runs to five major 

headings, 33 sub-headings and many more headings within these. We have 
moved a considerable way since the five headings used in a classification pro­
duced by Long in 1964 and the increasingly sophisticated classifications used by 

Naish in 1972, Lukehurst and Graves in 1972 and Corney in 1982. All of these 

125 

bibliographies, that drew only on the English langnage literature, have been 
carefully reviewed by John Lidstone in 1988. 

Thirdly, researchers from one language domain are generally unfamiliar with 
research undertaken in other language domains. Even when there is a possibility 
for researchers to present their work in either French or English, as in the sym­
posia of the Commission on Geographical Education of the International Geo­

graphical Union, remarkably few papers are presented in French. Researchers in 

geographical education from the Enghsh language domain very rarely quote 

recent research reported in languages other than English. This paper draws its 
evidence predominantly from research undertaken by workers in the English lan­
guage - and is limited by that. 

Fourthly, it is important to distinguish between researchdriven by the traditional 
educational disciplines - educational psychology, sociology of education, phi­
losophy of education and history of education - and research that is driven by 
concerns related to curriculum planning and curriculum implementation. For the 
latter the research motive is more to improve the institutional provision of geog­
raphy in schools, colleges and universities, rather than to progress the discipline 
of research in geographical education. Obvious consequences of this are, on the 
one hand, the need for researchtobe responsive to others' agendas and, on the 

other hand, the lack of continuity and linearity of studies. From this comes a ten­
sion between pure research and applied research and in geographical education 
there has conventionally been a strong leaning towards the latter. 

Fif1hly, we need to acknowledge the different emphases given by researchers in 
geographical education to the purposes of research. On one end of the spectrum 
are those who argue that all educational research should be driven by utilitari­
anism - the fruits of research should be seen in teaching and learning contexts. 
Research is the handmaiden of the geography teacher and the geography learner. 

At the other end of the spectrum are those who would argue that research has its 
own intri.nsic worth. The act of research is significant for the researcher, in the 
frrst instance, and then for those colleagues in the research community who share 
a mutual research interest - substantive or methodological. Those who favour the 
utilitarian position fmd themselves torn between local and national interests 
rather than international interests and there is always a temptation to engage more 
in narrative description than empirical investigation. They also fmd themselves 
drawn to the descriptions of work in progress as in the case of accounts of na­
tional or highly localised curriculum development projects, national changes in 

126 



school examinations, and national changes in the professional development of 
teachers. The penalty of such work is the loss of both theory and schotarship 
leading to an apparent temporary, ad hoc, focus on contemporary fads and fash­
ions. It is the loss of theory building and the construction and consolidation of 
schotarship that is the price paid for too great an emphasis on essentially descrip­
tive accounts of curriculum development and curriculum evaluation. Hartwig 
Haubrich has demonstrated a clear awareness of these problems and he has suc­

cessfully bridged theory and practice, principles and their application. 

Finally, in this general introduction, what is striking within the community of 
geographical education specialists is the high degree of harmony and lack of 
controversy and criticism that pervades their public expressions either in confer­
ences or in print. To that extent, it is a welcoming, supportive and essentially 
friendly community and this is particularly noticeable in the work of the Com­

mission on Geographical Education of the International Geographical Union pre­
sided over until recently by Hartwig Haubrich. 

With these opening remarks we can now turn to the three themes to which I 
referred earlier: how the subject changes; how students leam geography; and 
how teachers teach geography. 

2. The Changing Nature of Geography 

Under this heading I would refer to two principal aspects: conceptual clarification 
and historical analysis. Geography in schools in various countries has passed 
through a number of stages: moving from the largely descriptive to the analytical, 
from a regional emphasis to case studies and themes, from a focus on knowledge 
to an emphasis on skills, from a focus on the national to the international and the 
global. This has led researchers to examine the interaction of changes taking 

place in school curricula with changes taking place in universities and other insti­

tutions of higher education. It has, in recent years, led to studies of educational 

policy making as researchers have sought to identify the pressures - largely 
political and ideological - that have influenced the definition of school geogra­
phy. Further, geography in some countries has been pressed to the margins of 
school curricula and efforts have been made to bolster the subject in some coun­
tries, as in England and Wales, and torevive it in others, as in the United States. 

The drafting of the International Charter on Geographical Education by members 
of the Commission on Geographical Education of the International Geographical 
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Union, led by Hartwig Haubrich, in 1992 was a deliberate attempt to contribute 
to these efforts. Here we fmd a lucid justification for the inclusion of geography 

in school curricula, the identification of key questions and concepts and the 

highlighting of principles and strategies for implementing the proposals. For 
Haubrich, the publication and later translation of the Charter into a number of 
languages represents a fitting culmination to his work for the Commission and 
highlights the academic efforts he had made previously in the cause of promoting 
geography world-wide. Illustrative of this are the accounts of geographical edu­

cation drawn from 30 countriesthat he edited as an International Focus on Geo­

graphical Education in 1982, that he updated in 1987 as International Trends in 

Geographical Education and, more recently, the collection of papers on Europe 

and the World in Geography Education he edited for the Commission in 1994. 

These publications provide useful baseline data for future historical studies of 
geographical education. Future scholars will, no doubt, seek to analyse and ex­
plain using the skills of historians, comparativists and others the patterns and 
trends that emerge from these studies. The current vogue for policy studies and 
the attempts made to draw out the links between ideologies and curriculum poli­
cies and practices finds expression in research in geographical education and it is 
an area in which much work needs to be done. We have only to think of the ten­
sions implicit in internationalism, expressed in globalism and Europeanisation, 
on the one hand, and federalism, regionalism and nationalism, on the other, to 
indicate a direction of much fruitful research work in geographical education. 
International understanding is part of this, though only a part, and it is this theme 
that provides a bridge with my next topic: how students Ieam geography 

3. How students learn geography 

Any consideration of the complex processes of learning must take into account 
what is leamed and its significance, by whom, and in what time and place con­
texts. It is commonplace to categorise the outcomes of learning under three broad 
and inter-related headings : knowledge and understanding; attitudes and values; 
and skills. Foreach of these, geography-specific taxonomies have been defmed 
and they are helpful in providing the starring point for investigations of student 
learning. It must be emphasised that sturlies of learning should contribute to an 
understanding of the developmental processes that Iead to progress in students' 
acquisition ofknowledge, attitudes and skills. 
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In seeking to illustrate the geograpbical educators' special interests in leaming it 

is possible to identify a number of strong themes that have persisted over the last 

twenty five years. Possibly, the strongest of these themes is the research under­

taken into aspects of mapwork with school aged students. However, in reading 
through the reports of international conferences we ought not to be surprised by 

the amount of attention paid to aspects of leaming under the broad title interna­

tional understanding. On this occasion it is particularly appropriate that this 

should be a focus for our attention given the considerable contribution made in 

this area by Haubrich, and not least because of the amount of attention paid to 

international understanding in the bighly successful symposia he has organised in 
Freiburg, Boulder and Berlin for the Commission on Geograpbical Education of 

the International Geograpbical Union. 

Reading through the reports and publications emanating from the Commission it 

is possible to detect a number of sub-themes under the umbrella of international 

understanding. These include: 

- children's perceptions offoreign places; 

- children' s knowledge of foreign places; 

- children's attitudes towards foreign places and foreigners; 

- the representation of foreign countries in curriculum materials - textbooks, at-

lases, etc. - and the media.; 

The motives for researching these issues was well expressed by Hartwig 

Haubrich in the preface to the collection of papers presented at the Education 

Commission Symposium held in the Pädagogische Hochschule Freiburg as part 

ofthe 25th International Geograpbical Union Congress in 1984. He expressed bis 

belief that, in the face of daily international misunderstanding, regional crises and 

the danger of another world war with the end of civilization, themes traditionally 
referred to as 'international understanding' and, in more recent times referred to 

as 'peace education' should be fundamental topics for discussion in international 

meetings of geographers. In this symposium he introduced a paradigm on inter­

national understanding and co-operation and he was to retum to this in a number 
ofways. I shall refer to two. 

First, there was the imaginative sets of essays he and Hildegard, bis wife, col­

lected and published that were written by cbildren for children. Drawing on bis 

wide circle of friends, essays were gathered from cbildren in many countries. 

Children described their homes, their communities, their schools and their hob­
bies. 
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Secondly, there was the cross-cultural survey of students' international attitudes 

that he undertook more recently and discussed in a number of papers including 

one presented at the annual conference of the Geograpbical Association and to 

wbich he referred in the book produced for the International Geograpbical Con­

gress held in the Hague in 1996. The title ofthe paperwas "International under­

standing and cooperation through geograpbical education: how we see people and 
places", a theme that he had bighlighted in 1984 when the Commission on Geo­

grapbical Education of the International Geograpbical Union held its symposium 
in Freiburg, here at the Pädagogische Hochschule in 1984. Tbis has been a well­

established theme ofHaubrich's work, though not the only one as weshall see in 
the next partoftbis paper. 

4. How teachers teach geography 

Not surprisingly, this topic has attracted the attention of many scholars in the 

field of geograpbical education. If teaching is taken to include curriculum plan­

ning, curriculum development, lesson planning and presentation, and student 

assessment then there is a very rich literature focusing specifically upon geogra­
phy. Scholars in many countries have written about teaching strategies and 
teaching tactics. One has only to think of the substantial writing on such aspects 

as fieldwork, the use of textbooks, atlases and maps, the use of audio-visual aids, 
and, more recently, the application of the new technologies in geograpbical stud­
ies. 

One of the first papers I heard Hartwig Haubrich present was here in Freiburg in 

1984 under the title "Educational television for geography teaching- a pilot study 
of a content analysis". In it he drew on a number of studies he had previously 

undertaken (e.g. 1973a and b, 1975 and 1978). Using a theoretical communica­
tion model, he analysed a progranune from a series of television progranunes that 

he had devised for schools. He had also wntten teachmg aids, teacher and student 

booklets, to accompany the series. The paper was a detailed, almost shot by shot, 

analysis of the design and contents of the progranune. More recently, indicating 
how technology in geograpbical education has sbifted, in 1996 he presented a 
paper with Rands Jürgen Engelhard at the 28th International Geograpbical Con­
gress organised by the International Geograpbical Union in The Hague in 1996 
on the productiotl, implementation and evaluation of a computer program that 
they had devised. Based on the Monte Carlo simulation this program provides 

students with the opportunity to simulate landscapes, illustrating how geograpbi­
cal rules and chance interact in the evolution ofhuman environments. 
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the next partoftbis paper. 
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phy. Scholars in many countries have written about teaching strategies and 
teaching tactics. One has only to think of the substantial writing on such aspects 

as fieldwork, the use of textbooks, atlases and maps, the use of audio-visual aids, 
and, more recently, the application of the new technologies in geograpbical stud­
ies. 

One of the first papers I heard Hartwig Haubrich present was here in Freiburg in 

1984 under the title "Educational television for geography teaching- a pilot study 
of a content analysis". In it he drew on a number of studies he had previously 

undertaken (e.g. 1973a and b, 1975 and 1978). Using a theoretical communica­
tion model, he analysed a progranune from a series of television progranunes that 

he had devised for schools. He had also wntten teachmg aids, teacher and student 

booklets, to accompany the series. The paper was a detailed, almost shot by shot, 

analysis of the design and contents of the progranune. More recently, indicating 
how technology in geograpbical education has sbifted, in 1996 he presented a 
paper with Rands Jürgen Engelhard at the 28th International Geograpbical Con­
gress organised by the International Geograpbical Union in The Hague in 1996 
on the productiotl, implementation and evaluation of a computer program that 
they had devised. Based on the Monte Carlo simulation this program provides 

students with the opportunity to simulate landscapes, illustrating how geograpbi­
cal rules and chance interact in the evolution ofhuman environments. 
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Despite the efforts of Haubrich and others who have kept pace with the changing 
strategies and technologies available to geography teachers, there is a lack of any 
substantial body of research that has sought to measure the relative effectiveness 

of partiewar strategies and technologies applied to partiewar groups o~ ~tudents, 
differentiated by national and regional cultures, and student charactensncs such 
as ability, gender, age, and socio-economic class. We have also made very little 
progress in identifying the matehing of student learning in geography with 
teacher competence. How important are partiewar teacher competencies for 
student achievement in geography and what are the relationships between differ­
ent kinds of teaching qualifications and teacher performance and student 
achievement? These questions lead me to my conclusion in which I seek to lay 
out a highly selective agenda for future research directions in geographical edu­

cation. 

5. Conclusion: future directions 

W e can anticipate that there will be progress made both in the range of research 
methods used to investigate geographical education and in the substantive targets 

for such investigations. With regard to research methods the debate about the 

relative strengths and weaknesses of methods associated with positivist, interpre­
tive and critical traditions will persist (Williams 1996, Gerber 1996 and Fien I 
Hillcoat 1996). Time does not pennit a comprehensive and thorough presentation 
of an agenda for future studies and therefore I shall highlight some particularly 
important topics. 

The needs of policy makers will continue to lead to an emphasis on the collection 

of hard data, as witnessed in the increasing interest of govemments in the results 
of large-scale international studies, especially those conducted by the Interna­
tional Association for the Evaluation of Educational Achievement and the Inter­
national Assessment of Educational Progress (Stolnnan, 1996). Of partiewar 
interest to geographical educators is the work of the InterGeo Project of the 
Commission on Geographical Education of the International Geographical Union 
reported by Stol1:1nan I Niemz (1992a; 1992b). The data derived from such tests 
have a certain raw bluntness for those who seek to see educational achievement 
in the context of international economic competition. For geographical educators 

they pose a challenge to engage in cross-cultural, comparative studies that seek, 
in Philip Stimpson's (1996, p. 42) words to use 'the understanding of a popu­

lace's feelings and thoughts ... as viewpoints from which to interpret and explain 
educational differences between regions of the world or between sub-groups in 
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society within countries'. It is here that the International Geographical Union has 
such an extremely important role in bringing together geographical educators to 
engage in collaborative international studies. 

Without doubt, as I indicated earlier, there is a substantial amount of work to be 
done in studying teacher effectiveness in geographical education. W e need to 
focus sharply on the relative merits of commonly advocated strategies and the 
tactics within them. There is scope for major empirical studies on the learning 
processes and outcomes of aspects of fieldwork, inquiry approaches, and the 
application of old and new technologies in classrooms and other settings. W e 

need to know more about the changes in learning processes for students as they 
progress to become geographers - little and large. We need to address the impli­
cations for geography of increasing interest in the concept of lifelong learning. 

The importance of geographical learning for adults in general and selected pro­
fessional and vocational groups in partiewar has been generally neglected. There 
has been some attention paid to research related to the professional development 
of geography teachers, in pre-service and in-service contexts, but this too is a 
field deserving much closer empirical attention. 

Finally, there remains the continuing interest in the processes of curriculum 
development at various stages of educational systems and here I am referring to 
the clarification of changing defmitions of geography and the aims and purposes 
of geography in various cultures and at different stages in the differentiated 
experiences of children and students, the specification of instructional objectives, 
the selection of appropriate teaching and learning strategies, modes of student 
assessment and processes of curriculum evaluation. The bridge between theory 
and practice in curriculum planning, implementation and evaluation is a rich field 
of study and one in which the benefits for policy makers and practitioners are 
potentially useful. 

As we look back with Professor Hartwig Haubrich over recent decades we can 
see that much has been achieved and much remains to be accomplished. 
Haubrich has made a substantial contribution to geographical education in his 
research, his developmental work and in his internationalleadership. I fmd it dif­
ficult to believe that he will rest on his laureis and I, with colleagues and friends 
scattered across all of the continents, wish him and Hildegard a long and healthy 
retirement. They will continue to have a warm welcome in many homes including 
ours. 
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Abfall- und Kreislaufwirtschaft 
Grundlegung eines unvollendeten Werkes 

von HARTMUT VOLKMANNt 

[Redigiert: H. Köck] 

Vorbemerkung des Herausgebers: 
Der nachfolgend abgedruckte Beitrag stellt die Grundlegung zu einem unvollen­

deten Werk Hartmut Volkmanns dar. Er ist entstanden im Rahmen der vom 

Unterzeichner herausgegebenen Reihe "Unterricht Geographie" und speziell 

dort zu dem Band "Abfall- und Kreislaufivirtschaft". Im Jahre 1991 wurde die 

Erstellung dieses Bandes zwischen dem Herausgeber und Hartmut Volkmann 

vereinbart. Sein Titellautete zunächst "Müll" (1991), dann "Müll/Entsorgung" 

(1991), danach "Abfallwirtschaft!Müllentsorgung" (1992), schließlich" Von der 

Müllbeseitigung zur Kreislaufivirtschaft" (1995) und endlich, wie hier nun er­

kennbar, "Abfall- und Kreislaufivirtschaji" (1 996). Unter dieser Leitidee ist das 

Problem des Abfalls und seiner Entsorgung, das in der Geographie eher ein 

Randdasein führt, von Hartmut Volkmann schlüssig und weiterführend angegan­

gen worden. Die Vollendung des Bandes wurde infolge seines tragischen Todes 

verhindert. Einige Monate zuvor jedoch schickte Volkmann dem Herausgeber 

das nachfolgend wiedergegebene lediglich um das auch schon beigefügte Glos­

sar gekürzte Manuskript zur ersten kritischen Durchsicht. Wenngleich die weite­

ren Teile (Unterrichtseinheiten und Materialienteil) dann nicht mehr zustande-
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kamen, so stellt diese Grundlegung doch ein in sich abgeschlossenes Werk dar, 

das gerade auch im Sinne einer Standortbestimmung in bezug auf das Problem 

des Mülls aus geographischer Sicht von grundlegender Bedeutung ist. Aus die­

sem Grunde hat sich der Herausgeber entschlossen, dieses im Herbst 1996 vor­

gelegte Manuskript als eigenständigen Beitrag in 'Geographie und ihre Didak­

tik' zu veröffentlichen. Dem Aulis-Verlag Deubner, Köln, sei gedanktjur die Ab­

tretung der Rechte an diesem Manuskript. Alle vom Herausgeber vorgenomme­

nen Änderungen, mit Ausnahme orthographischer Korrekturen, sind durch 

eckige Klammer markiert und für den Leser leicht erkennbar. 

Helmuth Köck 

1. Einleitung 

Grüne und blaue Sammelbehälter, braune Biotonnen und gelbe Säcke - eine 

bunte Vielfalt hat das einst dominierende Grau der Müllabfuhr verdrängt. Nicht 

etwa, um den individuellen ästhetischen Empfmden der Bürgerinnen und Bürger 

Reclmung zu tragen. Im Gegenteil: das Farbspektrum taucht in nahezu jeder Ge­

meinde und vor jedem Haus in stereotyper Weise auf. Auch Form und Größe der 

Behälter wurden in der für unsere Zeit typtsehen Art vereinheitlicht. Die Farben 

sollen helfen, ein vordringliches Ziel zu erreichen: die bedrohlich anschwellende 

Abfallflut in Balmen zu lenken, die ihre potentiell zerstörensehe Energie absor­

bieren und denkbaren Notsituationen vorbeugen können. 

Die rasch anwachsenden Müllberge sind das Ergebnis unseres Wirtschaftssy­

stems und unserer oftmals gedankenlosen, nicht zukunftsfähigen Lebensweise. 

Böse Zungen behaupten, industrielle Produktion sei die inmter sclmellere Um­

wandlung von inmter mehr Rohstoffen mit immer größerem Energieaufwand zu 

Müll. Doch das ist nur die halbe Wahrheit. Ausschlaggebend ist, ob die Gebrau­

che:r industrieller Produkte sclmell oder langsam zu Verbrauchern werden. Diese 

Entscheidung trifft in vielen Fällen jeder von uns: ob wir ein Getränk in einer 

Einweg- oder Mehrwegflasche kaufen, ob wir ein Kleidungsstück einen oder 

mehrere Sommer lang tragen, ob wir ein Gerät reparieren lassen oder durch ein 

neues ersetzen: Der industrielle Durchsatz, die Lebensdauer der Produkte hängt 

somit von unserem Verhalten ab, das seinerseits wieder von unserem wirtschaft­

lichen Vermögen, unserem Wohlstand nachhaltig bestimmt wird. Je leichter wir 

uns kürzere Nutzungszeiten leisten können, desto größer ist die Neigung anderer 

am Wirtschaftsgeschehen Beteiligter, uns in diese Richtung zu drängen, z.B. 

durch bestinmtte Moden oder Produktformen. Wenn viele zu einer solchen 

Lebensweise nicht bereit oder nicht in der Lage sind, wird die Neigung dazu 
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